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8.5 x 11, Copy Paper 

Per FCSS 

Specifications

Case 15000 Veritiv Comet
Up To 30 

Days
$25.23 $378,450.00 Fascopy 7-21 Days $27.00 $405,000.00

Spectrum 

Georgia Pacific
21 Days $24.89 $373,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.5 x 11-3HP, Copy 

Paper Per FCSS 

Specifications

Case 100
Veritiv 

Econsource

Up To 30 

Days
$27.26 $2,726.00 Fascopy 7-21 Days $29.20 $2,920.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

HighSpeed 

851031HS

7-10 

Business

Days

$29.00 $2,900.00

8.5 x 14, Copy Paper 

Per FCSS 

Specifications

Case 40
Veritiv 

Econsource

Up To 30 

Days
$34.68 $1,387.20 Fascopy 7-21 Days $37.80 $1,512.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Wilcopy 

854001HS

7-10 

Business

Days

$38.34 $1,533.60

11 x 17, Copy Paper 

Per FCSS 

Specifications

Case 120
Veritiv 

Econsource

Up To 30 

Days
$27.26 $3,271.20 Fascopy 7-21 Days $29.20 $3,504.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Wilcopy 117001

7-10 

Business

Days

$32.40 $3,888.00

TOTAL 

Bid B19-02, Copy 

Paper

Unit of 

Issue Est. Qty

Notes

Veritiv

$385,834.40

Costco

N/A

Vendor no bid some product groups.

School Specialty

N/A

Vendor no bid some product groups.
Awarded Contract For Lowest Bid Meeting FCS 

Terms & Conditions

Contract Paper Group

$412,936.00


